
Broadway Songs For Kids That Will Delight
Every Little Performer

Do you have a little performer in your home who loves to belt out show tunes and
dream of dazzling the audience on Broadway? Broadway musicals have always
been a beloved art form, capturing the hearts of both young and old. What better
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way to nurture your child's love for theater than introducing them to Broadway
songs tailored just for kids?

Why Broadway Songs For Kids Are So Special

Broadway songs designed for children are not only entertaining, but they also
provide a valuable opportunity for kids to explore their imagination, develop their
vocal skills, and boost their confidence. These songs often have catchy tunes,
relatable lyrics, and inspiring messages that resonate with the young hearts.
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Whether your child dreams of being the next Annie, Matilda, or a star in their own
original musical, Broadway songs for kids offer a plethora of options to ignite their
passion for performing arts. So, let's dive into some of the most popular and
enchanting Broadway songs that will charm your young performers!

1. "Let It Go" – Frozen: The Broadway Musical
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It's no surprise that "Let It Go" tops the list of Broadway songs for kids. The
runaway success of Disney's Frozen turned this empowering anthem into a
global hit! This enchanting melody not only allows kids to embrace their inner
Elsa but also encourages them to be true to themselves and let go of their fears.

With soaring vocals and an unforgettable chorus, "Let It Go" has captured the
hearts of children worldwide. It's the perfect song to inspire confidence and
remind your young performer that they have the power to conquer any challenge.

2. "Revolting Children" – Matilda
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Based on the beloved novel by Roald Dahl, Matilda the Musical offers a plethora
of fun and inspiring songs that resonate with kids. One standout number is
"Revolting Children," which celebrates individuality and the importance of
standing up against injustice.

This catchy tune empowers children to embrace their uniqueness and fight for
what they believe in. With its rebellious spirit and energetic choreography,
"Revolting Children" is sure to ignite a fire in every little performer's heart.

3. "Tomorrow" – Annie
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No Broadway songs for kids list would be complete without mentioning the
timeless classic, "Tomorrow" from Annie. This heartwarming anthem inspires
hope and optimism, reminding children that a brighter future is always possible.

With its optimistic lyrics and catchy melody, "Tomorrow" is an excellent choice to
teach kids about resilience and the power of positive thinking. Singing along to
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this iconic song, your child will be filled with hope and the belief that anything is
achievable.

4. "You're Never Fully Dressed Without a Smile" – Annie

Another gem from the musical Annie, "You're Never Fully Dressed Without a
Smile" is a playful and uplifting tune that encourages kids to embrace their true

https://pdf-book-vault.web.app/free-book.html?pdf-file=eyJjdCI6ImNTMUJBK241Y3RyU2tIM0tDRG1IeTNpZHN6UWJneUo2U2E5Z3FCZDNlVVFLajU3dzJqSzF6NllKMmdvSnI1TlAyRVwvYWtLN3g4VkM4bVUzUWNVMGVHV2tmc1FpVHZpSGRyQnJ2RHFuTEVaXC9CRVwvNFlhQ0dmalFLbzhJSnlENHI1bVNBR3NcL3pcL2ZwaVwvQ0drelNaS1wvbWFxWkFDNW5UbVBZRDZXSHpnd2RGOG8wTGd4bmkzMXFSQ3FyU3JuV0dyY1FFQU9Kdyt0Wnllbm1qa1RnclV2TXNRPT0iLCJpdiI6IjUyMWE5YjUzNjczYWUxNmM5YmY1YjI4YjRiYmE3NjJmIiwicyI6IjQ0NzMzYmI2NWU4MGNkY2UifQ%3D%3D


selves. This catchy song teaches children that the best way to shine is by staying
true to their unique personality.

With its infectious rhythm and joyful lyrics, "You're Never Fully Dressed Without a
Smile" will have your little performer dancing and singing from start to finish.

5. "Naughty" – Matilda
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Matilda the Musical strikes again with the charming song "Naughty." This
delightful tune celebrates the power of curiosity and imagination, urging children
to let their creativity soar.

With lyrics that speak to every dreamer's heart, "Naughty" empowers children to
embrace their inner mischief-maker and find joy in pushing boundaries. It's a
song that encourages kids to think outside the box and believe in their own
magic.

Broadway songs possess the power to transport us to vibrant worlds filled with
excitement, dreams, and endless possibilities. When tailored for children, these
songs become a genuine source of inspiration, nurturing their love for performing
arts and fostering their creative spirit.

Integrating Broadway songs into your child's playlist offers a fantastic opportunity
for bonding and developing their musical abilities. So, pick a song, put on a
performance, and watch as your little star shines on their own Broadway stage!
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(Piano/Vocal/Guitar Songbook). More than 30 songs made famous by kids
singing on stage, arranged in piano/vocal/guitar notation. Includes: Castle on a
Cloud * Do-Re-Mi * Gary, Indiana * Getting Tall * I Just Can't Wait to Be King * I
Whistle a Happy Tune * I Won't Grow Up * It's the Hard-Knock Life * Let Me
Entertain You * Little People * So Long, Farewell * Tomorrow * Where Is Love? *
You're Never Fully Dressed Without a Smile * and more.
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